
Bedford Hills, New York 
       April 21, 2009 
 
 The second meeting for the month of April of the Town Board of the Town of 
Bedford was held on April 21, 2009 at the Town Offices, 321 Bedford Road, Bedford 
Hills, New York.  The meeting was called to order at 7:30 P.M. by Supervisor Roberts. 
       
 Present:  Lee V. A. Roberts    :Supervisor 
    Peter Chryssos       :Councilman 
    Francis Corcoran    :Councilman 
    Chris Burdick       :Councilman 
    
                       Lisbeth Fumagalli          :Town Clerk 
    Nancy Tagliafierro        :Town Attorney 
    Edward J. Ritter     :Town Comptroller 

William Heidepriem      :Supt. Of Recreation and Parks 
Amy Pectol       :Receiver of Taxes 

    Kevin Winn      :Commissioner of Public Works 
    Marcy Marchiano           :Asst. to Supervisor 
  

Absent:  David Gabrielson     :Councilman 
 

And three (3) residents/observers. 
 
APPROVAL OF CLAIMS 
On a motion by Mrs. Roberts, seconded by Mr. Chryssos, the following resolution was 
ADOPTED 
Ayes:  Roberts, Chryssos, Corcoran, Burdick 
Nays:  None 
Absent:  Gabrielson 
 

RESOLVED, that the following claims be allowed for payment from their 
respective funds, 
                    

General Fund $  34,333.43 
Highway Fund     10,187.15 
Special Districts:  
Bedford Village Memorial Park          574.45 
Bedford Hills Memorial Park          568.93 
Katonah Memorial Park          950.70 
Capital Projects       7,975.00
                                                             $   54,589.66 

 
MONTHLY REPORTS 
Building   Justice Court  Receiver of Taxes 
Code Enforcement  Parking  Recreation & Parks 
Dog Control   Police Consolidated Town Clerk 
Department of Public Works Finance 
 
Mrs. Roberts advised that the reports were available during normal business hours in the 
offices of the Town Clerk and the Supervisor. 
 
CORRESPONDENCE 

1. Notification from Tri-State Trek that they will be bicycling on roads in the Town 
of Bedford on July 26th to benefit the ALS Institute. 

 
The Town Board acknowledged the receipt of a letter dated April 14, 2009 from Scott 
Dunberg of the Tri-State Trek advising the Town of Bedford of the route for this event 
and what roads the bicyclists would be on in the Town. A Certificate of Insurance will be 
submitted and no services are needed from the Town. 
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OLD BUSINESS 
1. Approval of purchase of materials, equipment and services for Highway. 

On a motion by Mr. Burdick, seconded by Mr. Chryssos, the following resolution was 
ADOPTED 
Ayes:  Roberts, Chryssos, Corcoran, Burdick 
Nays:  None 
Absent:  Gabrielson 
 

RESOLVED that the Town Board does hereby approve the purchase of Highway 
Materials and services for the period May 1, 2009 to April 30, 2010 as per the 
memorandum dated April 15, 2009 from Commissioner of Public Works Kevin Winn as 
follows: 
Material/Service            Spec. Item    Vendor     Price                    Unit 
1A. Bituminous Concrete     
Base- Course Type 1 403.11 Peckham $68.00 FOB Pick Up Per Ton 
Base- Course Type 2 403.12 Peckham $68.00 FOB Pick Up Per Ton 
Binder- Course Type 3 403.13 Peckham $68.00 FOB Pick Up Per Ton 
Binder- Course Type 4 403.14 Peckham $68.00 FOB Pick Up Per Ton 
Shim- Course Type 6 403.15 Peckham $68.00 FOB Pick Up Per Ton 
Top- Course Type 6 403.16 Peckham $68.00 FOB Pick Up Per Ton 
Top Course Type 6F2 403.17 Peckham $68.00 FOB Pick Up Per Ton 
Top Course Type 7 403.18 Peckham $75.00 FOB Pick Up Per Ton 
Top Course Type 7F 403.19 Peckham $75.00 FOB Pick Up Per Ton 
Asphaltic Concrete Curb 714.06 Peckham $79.00 FOB Pick Up Per Ton 
Asphaltic Concrete 
Stockpile Patch Winter Mix 
Bulk/Loose FOB Delivered  

403.2001 RCA $105.00 Delivered & 
placed with a paving 
machine per net ton 

Per Ton 

Asphaltic Concrete Type 6 
& 7 (In place complete per 
ton) 

403.16 
403.17 

Bilotta $86.45 Delivered & 
placed with a paving 
machine per net ton 

Per Ton 

Asphaltic Concrete Type 1 
(In place complete per ton) 

403.11 Bilotta $86.00 Delivered & 
placed with a paving 
machine per net ton 

Per Ton 

Asphaltic Concrete Type 3 
(In place complete per ton) 

403.13 Bilotta $86.00 Delivered & 
placed with a paving 
machine per net ton 

Per Ton 

 
Material/Service            Spec. Item    Vendor     Price                    Unit 
1B. Cold Patch     
Bituminous Bagged & 
Palletized All Weather Cold 
Patch Mix 

a. Package 
Pavement 

$5.15 Delivered Per Bag 

Bituminous All Weather 
Bagged & Palletized Cold 
Patch Mix 

b. Package 
Pavement 

$4.45 For DPW 
Pickup at Plant 

Per Bag 

Bulk, Loose Bituminous 
Cold Patch 

c. Package 
Pavement 

$72.00 For DPW 
Pickup at Plant 

Per Ton 

Bagged & Palletized 
“Green” Cold Patch Mix 

d. Package 
Pavement 

$5.75 Delivered Per Bag 

Bagged & Palletized 
“Green” Cold Patch Mix 

e.1 Package 
Pavement 

$5.40 For DPW 
Pickup at Plant 

Per Bag 

Bulk, Loose “Green” Cold 
Patch Mix 

e.2 Package 
Pavement 

$107.00 For DPW 
Pickup at Plant 

Per Ton 

 
Material/Service            Spec. Item    Vendor     Price                    Unit 
2. Crushed/Washed 
Blue/Gray Stone Delivered 

    

NYSDOT Specification 
703-02 & 703-04 

    

Type 2 ¾” 
Stone 

Lee 
Trucking 

$21.47 Per Ton 
Delivered 
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Type 3A 1 ¼” 
Stone 

Lee 
Trucking 

$19.10 Per Ton 
Delivered 

Type 3 1 ½” 
Stone 

Lee 
Trucking 

$21.00 Per Ton 
Delivered 

Type 4 3 ½” 
Stone 

Tie Lee 
Trucking 
and MJB 
– orders to 
be split 

$24.00 Per Ton 
Delivered 

620-02 Fine Stone Fill 4” + or - 
Stone 

Tie Lee 
Trucking 
and MJB 
– orders to 
be split 

$24.00 Per Ton 
Delivered 

620-03 Lite Stone Fill 10” + or 
- Stone 

Lee 
Trucking 

$27.00 Per Ton 
Delivered 

620-04 Medium Stone Fill 18”+ or 
- Stone 

Lee 
Trucking 

$27.00 Per Ton 
Delivered 

 
Material/Service            Spec. Item    Vendor     Price                    Unit 
2.A.Crushed Washed 
Blue/Gray Stone - DPW 
pickup at Vendor’s facility. 

    

NYSDOT Specification 
703-02 & 703-04 

    

Type 2 ¾” 
Stone 

Redwing $13.00 Per Ton 

Type 3A 1 ¼” 
Stone 

Redwing $13.00 Per Ton 

Type 3 1 ½” 
Stone 

Wingdale $17.00 Per Ton 

Type 4 3 ½” 
Stone 

Tilcon $25.25 Per Ton 

620-02 Fine Stone Fill 4” + or - 
Stone 

Thalle $20.00 Per Ton 

620-03 Lite Stone Fill 10” + or 
- Stone 

Wingdale $22.00 Per Ton 

620-04 Medium Stone Fill 18” + or 
- Stone 

Wingdale $22.00 Per Ton 

 
Material/Service            Spec. Item    Vendor     Price                    Unit 
3. Crushed White Limestone 
Delivered to DPW 

    

NYSDOT Specification 
703-02 & 703-04 

    

Type 2 ¾” 
Stone 

Lee 
Trucking 

$20.70 Per Ton 

Type 3A 1 ¼” 
Stone 

Lee 
Trucking 

$20.70 Per Ton 

Type 3 1 ½” 
Stone 

Lee 
Trucking 

$20.70 Per Ton 

Type 4 3 ½” 
Stone 

JCL 
Trucking 

$24.50 Per Ton 

620-02 Fine Stone Fill 4” + or - 
Stone 

MJB Ent. $23.50 Per Ton 

620-03 Lite Stone Fill 10” + or 
- Stone 

MJB Ent. $23.50 Per Ton 

620-04 Medium Stone Fill 18” + or 
- Stone 

JCL 
Trucking 

$28.50 Per Ton 
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Material/Service            Spec. Item    Vendor     Price                    Unit 
3.A. Crushed White 
Limestone for DPW pickup 
at Vendor’s Facility 

    

NYSDOT Specification 
703-02 & 703-04 

    

Type 2 ¾” 
Stone 

Putnam 
Materials 

$17.00 Per Ton 

Type 3A 1 ¼” 
Stone 

Putnam 
Materials 

$17.00 Per Ton 

Type 3 1 ½” 
Stone 

Putnam 
Materials 

$17.00 Per Ton 

Type 4 3 ½” 
Stone 

N/A NO BID Per Ton 

620-02 Fine Stone Fill 4” + or - 
Stone 

Putnam 
Materials 

$22.00 Per Ton 

620-03 Lite Stone Fill 10” + or 
- Stone 

Putnam 
Materials 

$22.00 Per Ton 

620-04 Medium Stone Fill 18” + or 
- Stone 

Putnam 
Materials 

$22.00 Per Ton 

 
Material/Service            Spec. Item    Vendor     Price                    Unit 
4. Course Washed Dark 
Brown NYS Specification 
Winter Sand Delivered 

NYS 
Spec. 

Lee 
Trucking 

$20.87 Per Ton 

 
Material/Service            Spec. Item    Vendor     Price                    Unit 
5. Course Screened Dark 
Brown Winter Sand 
Delivered 

N/A Lee 
Trucking 

$20.87 Per Ton 

 
Material/Service            Spec. Item    Vendor     Price                    Unit 
6. Course Washed Long 
Island Sand 

Long 
Island 

Lee 
Trucking 

$28.00 Per Ton 

 
Material/Service            Spec. Item    Vendor     Price                    Unit 
7. Crushed Washed Gravel 
NYSDOT Specification 

    

3/8” Delivered NYS 
Spec.  

Redwing $20.50 Per Ton 

¾” Delivered NYS 
Spec 

Redwing $20.00 Per Ton 

 
Material/Service            Spec. Item    Vendor     Price                    Unit 
8A. Run of Bank Gravel 
Delivered 

6” – 
(Minus) 

Redwing $21.00 Per Ton 

Material/Service            Spec. Item    Vendor     Price                    Unit 
8B. Processed Run of Bank 
Gravel NYS Specification 
Delivered 

Item 
#4/1” 
(Minus) 
Stone 

Lee 
Trucking 

$21.00 Per Ton 

 
Material/Service            Spec. Item    Vendor     Price                    Unit 
9A. Item #4 Shoulder Stone 
¾” Blue Gray Stone 
NYSDOT Spec. Delivered 

NYS 
Spec. 

Lee 
Trucking 

$17.87 Per Ton 

Material/Service            Spec. Item    Vendor     Price                    Unit 
9A.1 Item #4 Shoulder 
Stone ¾” Blue Gray Stone 
NYSDOT Spec. For DPW 
Pickup at Vendor’s. 

NYS 
Spec. 

Redwing $12.00 Per Ton 
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Material/Service            Spec. Item    Vendor     Price                    Unit 
9B. Item #4 Shoulder Stone 
¾” Limestone NYSDOT 
Spec Delivered 

NYS 
Spec. 

Lee 
Trucking 

$17.87 Per Ton 

 
Material/Service            Spec. Item    Vendor     Price                    Unit 
9B.1. Item #4 Shoulder 
Stone ¾” Limestone 
NYSDOT Spec. For DPW 
Pickup at Vendor’s 

NYS 
Spec. 

Putnam 
Materials 

$12.50 Per Ton 

 
Material/Service            Spec. Item    Vendor     Price                    Unit 
9C. Item #4 Reprocessed ¾” 
Limestone NYSDOT Spec. 
1” – (Minus) Delivered 

N/A Peckham $11.00 Per Ton 

 
Material/Service            Spec. Item    Vendor     Price                    Unit 
9C.1. Item #4 Reprocessed 
¾” Limestone NYSDOT 
Spec. 1” – (Minus) For 
DPW Pickup at Vendor’s 

N/A Peckham $6.00 Per Ton 

 
Material/Service            Spec. Item    Vendor     Price                    Unit 
10. Guide Rail and Post 
Installation and Cable / 
Guide Rail Installation 

N/A Chemung Only Bidder on All 
Need items. 

Varies 

Complete layout and install 
of GR & Posts 

  $7.95 Per L.F. 

Corrugated beam type GR 
punched 6’3” 

  $6.64 Per L.F. 

Corrugated beam type GR 
punched 6’3” curved to 
radius 

  $110.00 50’ and 
up 

Same   $110.00 40’ o 50’ 
Same   $110.00 30’ to 39’ 
Same   $110.00 20’ to 29’ 
Corrugated beam type GR 
13’61/2” shop curved 
approach and terminal-
rotation 90○ 

  $120.00 Each 

3” x 2 3/8” I Intermediate 
GR post = 5’3” 

  $47.72  Each 

Flared type terminal 
sections 12 gauge 

  $38.80 Each 

Wrap around type sections 
12 gauge 

  $46.08 Each 

Concrete anchor unit 
w/hardware 

  $495.00 Each 

Galvanized splice bolts 1 ¼ 
“ x 5/8” 

  $0.99 Each 

Galvanized posts 5/16” x 1 
¾” w/water & nuts 

  $0.99 Each 

Galvanized post bolts 2” x 
5/8” 

  $0.99 Each 

Galvanized support bolts ½” 
x 1 ½”, 2 nuts, no washers 

  $1.04 Each 

6”x6”x24’ Box Beam(self 
angle, splice plates, 
nuts&bolts 

  $34.40 L.F. 

6”x6” Box beam curved to 
special radius 

  $49.40 Per L.F. 
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6”x6” Box beam shop cuts 
mitered curve 

  $76.80 Per L.F. 

6”x6” Box beam end 
sections 

  $498.00 Each 

3” I beam rail post 5’3” 
intermediate type 

  $47.72 Each 

3” I beam rail post 3’8” end 
type post 

  $44.24 Each 

Corrugated box beam and 
GR meeting Mayari Specs 

    

Corrugated beam type GR 
punched 6’3” 

  $6.64 Per L.F. 

Corrugated beam type GR 
punched 6’3” curved to 
radius 

  $110.00 50’ and 
up 

Same   $110.00 40’ o 50’ 
Same   $110.00 30’ to 39’ 
Same   $110.00 20’ to 29’ 
Corrugated beam type GR 
13’61/2” shop curved 
approach and terminal-
rotation 90○ 

  $125.00 Each 

3” x 2 3/8” I Intermediate 
GR post = 5’3” 

  $49.50 Each 

Flared type terminal 
sections 12 gauge 

  $39.90 Each 

Wrap around type sections 
12 gauge 

  $48.50 Each 

6”x6”x24’ Box Beam(self 
angle, splice plates, 
nuts&bolts 

  $34.40 L.F. 

6”x6” Box beam curved to 
special radius 

  $34.18 Per L.F. 

6”x6” Box beam shop cuts 
mitered curve 

  $46.08 Per L.F. 

6”x6” Box beam end 
sections 

  $525.00 Each 

3” I beam rail post 5’3” 
intermediate type 

  $49.90 Each 

3” I beam rail post 3’8” end 
type post 

  $46.50 Each 

Cable Guide Rail     
¾” Galvanized wire 3 strand 
(7 wires/strand) 

  $21.94 L.F. 

Hook Bolts 5/16” x 1 ¾” 
w/2 nuts 

  $1.92 Each 

Turnbuckle end assembly 
w/wedge 

  $78.10 Each 

Spring end assembly 
w/wedge 

  $144.08 Each 

End post cap complete   $179.03 Each 
End post ground support 
complete 

  $38.04 Each 

Breakaway anchor angle   $224.40 Each 
Cable splice w/2wedges   $94.40 Each 
Delineator complete   $19.08 Each 
Intermediate post 
Galvanized 

  $54.60 Each 

Intermediate post Mayari   $52.09 Each 
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Material/Service            Spec. Item    Vendor     Price                    Unit 
11a.1 Liquid Calcium 
Chloride 32% with 
Corrosion Inhibitor 
Delivered 

Orders 
Less 
than 
4000 gal 

James 
Reed 

$1.24 Per 
Gallon 

11a.2. Liquid Calcium 
Chloride 32% with 
Corrosion Inhibitor 
Delivered 

Orders 
More 
than 
4000 gal 

James 
Reed 

$1.24 Per 
Gallon 

 
Material/Service            Spec. Item    Vendor     Price                    Unit 
11b.1 Liquid Calcium 
Chloride 34% with 
Corrosion Inhibitor 
Delivered 

Orders 
Less 
than 
4000 gal 

James 
Reed 

$1.24 Per 
Gallon 

11b.2. Liquid Calcium 
Chloride 34% with 
Corrosion Inhibitor 
Delivered 

Orders 
More 
than 
4000 gal 

James 
Reed 

$1.24 Per 
Gallon 

 
Material/Service            Spec. Item    Vendor     Price                    Unit 
11c. Single (70 gal capacity) 
Liquid Calcium Tank 

N/A Reed 
Systems 

$1580.00 EA. 

 
Material/Service            Spec. Item    Vendor     Price                    Unit 
11d. Double Tank Unit (140 
gal capacity) Liquid 
Calcium Tank 

N/A Reed 
Systems 

$2270.00 EA. 

 
Material/Service            Spec. Item    Vendor     Price                    Unit 
11e.1 Installation cost for 
mounting calcium tanks on 
trucks 

N/A Reed 
Systems 

$500.00 EA 

11e.2. Installation cost for 
mounting calcium tanks at 
Town Garage additional 

N/A Reed 
Systems 

$300.00 EA 

 
Material/Service            Spec. Item    Vendor     Price                    Unit 
12a.1. Liquid Magnesium 
Chloride 25% with 
Corrosion Inhibitor 
Delivered 

Orders 
Less 
than 
4000 gal 

James 
Reed 

$1.05 Per 
Gallon 

12a.2. Liquid Calcium 
Chloride 32% with 
Corrosion Inhibitor 
Delivered 

Orders 
More 
than 
4000 gal 

James 
Reed 

$1.05 Per 
Gallon 

Material/Service            Spec. Item    Vendor     Price                    Unit 
13a. Liquid Enviro-brine 
35% with Corrosion 
Inhibitor Delivered and 
Applied to Road 

Standard 
Mix 

James 
Reed 

$0.89 Per 
Gallon 

13b. Liquid Enviro-brine 
35% with Corrosion 
Inhibitor Delivered and 
Applied to Road 

Surface 
Binding 
Agent 
added 

James 
Reed 

$0.94 Per 
Gallon 

 
Material/Service            Spec. Item    Vendor     Price                    Unit 
13c. Liquid Enviro-brine 
35% with Corrosion 
Inhibitor Delivered to 
Bedford DPW 

Standard 
Mix 

James 
Reed 

$0.89 Per 
Gallon 
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13d. Liquid Enviro-brine 
35% with Corrosion 
Inhibitor Delivered to 
Bedford DPW 

Surface 
Binding 
Agent 
added 

James 
Reed 

$0.94 Per 
Gallon 

 
Material/Service            Spec. Item    Vendor     Price                    Unit 
14. Potassium Chloride 
Flakes, Snow Melt Bagged 
and Palletized Delivered to 
DPW 

N/A NO BID NO BID EA. 

 
Material/Service            Spec. Item    Vendor     Price                    Unit 
15a. Reflectorized Double 
Yellow Latex Pavement 
Marking Paint Applied 

Double 
4” wide 
Center 
Lines 25 
miles +/-

Seneca $247.00  Per Mile 

15b. Reflectorized Single 
White Edge Line Latex 
Pavement Marking Paint 
Applied 

4” wide 
Shoulder 
Edge 
Lines 

Seneca $147.00  Per Mile 

 
Material/Service            Spec. Item    Vendor     Price                    Unit 
16a. Reflectorized Double 
Yellow Epoxy Pavement 
Marking Paint Applied 

Double 
4” wide 
Center 
Lines 25 
miles +/-

Highway 
Safety 

$1850.00  Per Mile 

16b. Reflectorized Single 
White Edge Line Epoxy 
Pavement Marking Paint 
Applied 

4” wide 
Shoulder 
Edge 
Lines 

Highway 
Safety 

$950.00  Per Mile 

 
Material/Service            Spec. Item    Vendor     Price                    Unit 
17. Thermoplastic Pavement 
Markings Installed on 
Pavement 

    

17a. 4” Double Yellow Double 
4” wide 
Center 
Lines 

Highway 
Safety 

$0.90 Per Lin. 
Foot 

17b. 4” White Single White 
Edge 

Single 
4” wide 
Shoulder 
Line 

Highway 
Safety 

$0.49 Per Lin. 
Foot 

17c. Stop Bar/Cross Walk 12” 
wide 
marking 
lines 

Highway 
Safety 

$1.60 Per Sq. 
Foot 

17d. Symbol RXR Crossing Stencil 
and lines

Safety 
Marking 

$198.00 Each 

17e. Arrow Directional 
Marking 

Stencil Highway 
Safety 

$75.00 Each 

17f. Handicap Parking (Blue 
Lines) 

Stencil 
and lines

Highway 
Safety and 
Safety 
Marking 
Both Tie 

$40.00 Each 

17g. School Zone Marking Stencil / 
Letters 

Highway 
Safety 

$40.00 Per Letter 
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17h. Removal of Lines  Highway 
Safety and 
Safety 
Marking 
Both Tie 

$0.95 Per Sq. 
Foot 

     
 
Material/Service            Spec. Item    Vendor     Price                    Unit 
18. Precast Concrete Catch 
Basins 

    

18a. Type A 36” sump and 
flat top w/ grate 

 Eastern 
Precast 

$490.00 Each 

18b. Type B 48” sump and 
flat top w/grate 

 Eastern 
Precast 

$545.00 Each 

18c. Type A 36” sump  Eastern 
Precast 

$215.00 Each 

18d. Type B 48” sump  Eastern 
Precast 

$270.00 Each 

18e. Flat top with Grates  Eastern 
Precast 

$275.00 Each 

18f. Curb top with Grates  Eastern 
Precast 

$285.00 Each 

18g. Sump Extension 12” 
high 

 Eastern 
Precast 

$90.00 Each 

18i. Sump Extension 24” 
high 

 Eastern 
Precast 

$130.00 Each 

 
Material/Service            Spec. Item    Vendor     Price                    Unit 
19a. Concrete Block Full 
Size 8’ Long 

 M&M 
Precast 

$246.00 Each 

19b. Concrete Block Half 
Size 4’ Long 

 M&M 
Precast 

$152.00 Each 

 
Material/Service            Spec. Item    Vendor     Price                    Unit 
20. Concrete Delivered & 
Poured In Place at Worksite 

    

20a. 3000 psi Concrete 
Delivered 

2 cy  
Drop 

Dakota 
Supply 

$474.00 Per Drop 

20b.  3000 psi Concrete 
Delivered 

4 cy 
Drop 

Dakota 
Supply 

$673.00 Per Drop 

20c. 3000 psi Concrete 
Delivered 

6cy 
Drop 

Dakota 
Supply 

$842.00 Per Drop 

20d. 3000 psi Concrete 
Delivered 

8cy 
Drop 

Dakota 
Supply 

$1021.00 Per Drop 

20e. 3000 psi Concrete 
Delivered 

10cy 
Drop 

Dakota 
Supply 

$1270.00 Per Drop 

20f.  3000 psi Concrete 
Delivered 

12 cy 
Drop 

Dakota 
Supply 

$1519.00 Per Drop 

20g.  3000 psi Concrete 
Delivered 

14 cy 
Drop 

Dakota 
Supply 

$1768.00 Per Drop 

20h.  3000 psi Concrete 
Delivered 

16 cy 
Drop 

Dakota 
Supply 

$2017.00 Per Drop 

 
Material/Service            Spec. Item    Vendor     Price                    Unit 
21a. Acrylic Marking Paint 
(white) in 5 gal. Pails 
delivered. 

N/A NO BID N/A N/A 

21b. Acrylic Marking Paint 
(white) in 5gal. Pails for 
DPW Pickup at Vendor’s 
site. 

N/A NO BID N/A N/A 
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Material/Service            Spec. Item    Vendor     Price                    Unit 
22. Skid Steer Rental     
22a. Rental of a 44” or less 
wide skid steer with heated 
cab and 48” wide snow 
plow 

Per 
Week 
Rental 

Bobcat of 
NY 

$800.00 Per Week 

22b. Rental of a 44” or less 
wide skid steer with heated 
cab and 48” wide snow 
plow 

Per 
Month 
Rental 

Bobcat of 
NY 

$2400.00 Per 
Month 

 
Material/Service            Spec. Item    Vendor     Price                    Unit 
23. Mini Rubber Tracked 
Excavator Rental (VOLVO 
ECR 88 or Equivalent) 

    

23a. Rental of Mini 
Excavator Delivered to 
Worksite for Week  

Per 
Week 
Rental 

United 
Rentals 

$1.000.00 Per Week 

23b. Rental of Mini 
Excavator for Month 

Per 
Month 
Rental 

United 
Rentals 

$2,700.00 Per 
Month 

 
Material/Service            Spec. Item    Vendor     Price                    Unit 
24. Small Double Drum 
Pavement Roller Rental 
(Dynapac CC800 or 
equivalent) 

    

24a. Rental of Small 
Pavement Roller Delivered 
to Worksite for Week 

Per 
Week 
Rental 

United 
Rentals 

$200.00 Per Week 

24b.Rental of Small 
Pavement Roller Delivered 
to Worksite for Month 

Per 
Month 
Rental 

United 
Rentals 

$500.00 Per 
Month 

 
Material/Service            Spec. Item    Vendor     Price                    Unit 
25. Portable Diesel Powered 
Flood Light Tower Rental 
(Terex AL 4000 or 
equivalent) 

    

25a. Rental of Portable 
Diesel Powered Flood Light 
Tower  Delivered for Week. 

Per 
Week 
Rental 

United 
Rentals 

$250.00 Per Week 

25b. Rental of Portable 
Diesel Powered Flood Light 
Rental Delivered for Month. 

Per 
Month 
Rental 

United 
Rentals 

$425.00 Per 
Month 

 
Material/Service            Spec. Item    Vendor     Price                    Unit 
26. Rental of a Powered 
Street Sweeping Machine 
(Elgin “Broom Bear” or 
equivalent.) 

    

26a. Rental of a powered 
street sweeping machine 
Delivered for Week. 

Per 
Week 
Rental 

Three D $2,000.00 Per Week 

26b. Rental of a powered 
street sweeping machine 
Delivered for Month. 

Per 
Month 
Rental 

Three D $7,500.00 Per 
Month 

Material/Service            Spec. Item    Vendor     Price                    Unit 
26b.1. Powered Street 
Sweeping Machine Operator 

Per Day 
Rental 

Three D $328.00 Per Day 
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Material/Service            Spec. Item    Vendor     Price                    Unit 
27. Rental of a Powered 
Vacuum Truck Mounted 
Catch Basin Cleaning 
Machine.) 

    

27a. Rental of a Powered 
Catch Basin Cleaning 
Machine Delivered for 
Week. 

Per 
Week 
Rental 

Acorn 
Thompson

$3080.00 Per Week 

27b. Rental of a Powered 
Catch Basin Cleaning 
Machine Delivered for 
Month. 

Per 
Month 
Rental 

Acorn 
Thompson

$9238.00 Per 
Month 

 
Material/Service            Spec. Item    Vendor     Price                    Unit 
28. Road Milling/Cold 
Plane 

    

28a. Full Width Road 
Milling of Entire Road 
Surface per 2” Depth 

Full 
Width 
Milling 

Garrity 
Asphalt 

$3.95 Per 
Square 
Yard 

28b. Shoulder Road Milling 
of  4’ to 6’ wide path along 
curb line / road shoulders & 
structures per 2” Depth 

Shoulder 
Milling 

Garrity 
Asphalt 

$4.95 Per  
Square 
Yard 

 
Material/Service            Spec. Item    Vendor     Price                    Unit 
29. Road Reclaiming Full 
Depth (c. 10”) 

    

29a. Base Price for Road 
Reclamation at 10” depth. 

Road 
Reclaim. 

Reclaim 
Kingston 

$2.24 Per Sq. 
Yard 

29b.  Foamed Asphalt PG 
Binder Treatment to be used 
in conjunction with 29a. 
above, 

Foamed 
Asphalt 
Treat-
ment 

Reclaim 
Kingston 

$7.20 Per Sq. 
Yard 

29e. Calcium Chloride 
Treatment alternative to 
Foamed Asphalt Treatment 
cited in 29b. above. 

Calcium 
Chloride 
Treat-
ment 

Reclaim 
Kingston 

$1.47 Per Sq. 
Yard 

29g. Portland Cement for 
road stabilization. 

1% Per 
Sq. Yd. 

Reclaim 
Kingston 

$0.79 Per Sq. 
Yard 

29h. Price to raise/lower 
cover and adjust manholes, 
catch basins, structures, etc. 

Utility 
Structure 
Adjust-
ment 

Reclaim 
Kingston 

$350.00 Each 

29i. Price to cart material to 
and from worksite to DPW 
Facility at Crusher Road 

Material 
Carting 

Reclaim 
Kingston 

$16.00 Per Cubic 
Yard 

 
Material/Service            Spec. Item    Vendor     Price                    Unit 
30A. Tree Removal 12” or 
less Diameter 

0-12” 
Diam. 

All 
American 

$99.00 Per Tree 

30B. Tree Removal 12” - 
18” Diameter 

12-18” 
Diam. 

All 
American 

$257.00 Per Tree 

30C. Tree Removal 18” - 
24” Diameter 

18”-24” 
Diam. 

All 
American 

$475.00 Per Tree 

30D. Tree Removal 24”- 
30” Diameter 

24”-30” 
Diam. 

All 
American 

$749.00 Per Tree 

30E. Tree Removal 30” - 
36” Diameter 

30”- 36” 
Diam. 

All 
American 

$830.00 Per Tree 

30F. Tree Removal 36”- 42” 
Diameter 

36”-42” 
Diam. 

All 
American 

$1,000.00 Per Tree 
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30G. Tree Removal 42”- 
48” Diameter 

42”-48” 
Diam. 

All 
American 

$1,475.00 Per Tree 

30H. Tree Removal 48” or 
greater Diameter 

48” or 
greater 
Diam. 

All 
American 

$1,800.00 Per Tree 

30I. Stump Removal up to 
12” Diameter 

0”-12” 
Diam. 

 $35.00 Per 
Stump 

     
30J. Stump Removal 12” - 
18” Diameter 

12”-18” 
Diam. 

All 
American 

$45.00 Per 
Stump 

30K. Stump Removal 18” - 
24” Diameter 

18”-24” 
Diam. 

All 
American 

$50.00 Per 
Stump 

30L. Stump Removal 24” - 
30” Diameter 

24”-30” 
Diam. 

All 
American 

$75.00 Per 
Stump 

30M. Stump Removal 30” - 
36” Diameter 

30”-36” 
Diam. 

All 
American 

$90.00 Per 
Stump 

30N. Stump Removal 36”-
42” Diameter 

36”-42” 
Diam. 

All 
American 

$110.00 Per 
Stump 

30O. Stump Removal 42”-
48” Diameter 

42”-48” 
Diam. 

All 
American 

$125.00 Per 
Stump 

30P. Stump Removal 48” 
Diameter or greater 

48” or 
greater 
Diam. 

All 
American 

$140.00 Per 
Stump 

 
Material/Service            Spec. Item    Vendor     Price                    Unit 
30.Emergency Tree Work     
30A. Arial Lift Bucket 
Truck with operator and 
hoisting / cutting 
equipment. 

Bucket 
Truck & 
Operator 

Save-a-
Tree 

$98.75 Per Hour 

30B. Brush Chipper and 
Operator 

Brush 
Chipper & 
Operator 

Save-a-
Tree 

$85.50 Per Hour 

30C. Forestry Truck and 
Operator 

Forestry 
Truck & 
Operator 

Save-a-
Tree 

$93.85 Per Hour 

30D. Additional Operators 
as needed. 

Additional 
Workers 

Save-a-
Tree 

$41.00 Per Hour 

 
2. Request for approval of low bidder for borings for Water Filtration Plant and 

Bedford Village Water Storage Tank. 
On a motion by Mr. Chryssos, seconded by Mr. Burdick, the following resolution was 
ADOPTED 
Ayes:  Roberts, Chryssos, Corcoran, Burdick 
Nays:  None 
Absent:  Gabrielson 
 
 RESOLVED that the Town Board does hereby award the contract for soil test 
borings at the site of the proposed water filtration plant and Bedford Village water 
storage tank to the lowest, most responsible bidder, Aquifer Drilling and Testing, Inc., 
150 Nassau Terminal Road, New Hyde Park, New York 11040 in the amount of 
$55,400.00 subject to the approval of bonds and insurance by the Town Attorney and 
Town insurance advisors, as per the memorandum dated April 16, 2009 from James J. 
Hahn, Town Consulting Engineer.  
 

3. Bid results for hybrid SUV’s. 
On a motion by Mrs. Roberts, seconded by Mr. Burdick, the following resolution was 
ADOPTED 
Ayes:  Roberts, Chryssos, Corcoran, Burdick 
Nays:  None 
Absent:  Gabrielson 
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 RESOLVED that the Town Board does hereby approve the purchase of three (3) 
2009 Ford Escape Hybrid SUV’s as follows: 
2 – from Rye Ford at a cost of $31,920 each and 1 from Pleasantville Ford at a cost of 
$31,576.45, with funding for the purchase of the vehicles available in the 2009 Capital 
Projects, as per the memorandum dated April 15, 2009 from Edward Ritter, Town 
Comptroller.  
 
NEW BUSINESS 

1. Request to solicit bids for winter safety cover for Bedford Village Park main pool. 
On a motion by Mr. Corcoran, seconded by Mr. Burdick, the following resolution was 
ADOPTED 
Ayes:  Roberts, Chryssos, Corcoran, Burdick 
Nays:  None 
Absent:  Gabrielson 
 
 RESOLVED that the Town Board does hereby approve the request form William 
Heidepriem, Superintendent of Recreation and Parks to solicit for bids for a winter safety 
pool cover for the pool at the Bedford Village Memorial Park as per the memorandum 
submitted by Mr. Heidepriem dated April 16, 2009. 
 
Mrs. Roberts announced that two (2) groups from the Town of Bedford had received 
Sustainability Awards from Westchester County – the Bedford Garden Club and the 
Bedford Energy Advisory Panel as well as Dr. Marion Rose for her work on the Croton 
Watershed Commission and offered her congratulations to all. 
 
There being no further discussion, the meeting was adjourned at 7:51 P.M. 
 
 
    __________________________ 
    Lisbeth Fumagalli, Town Clerk 
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